
 

Jaguar XF 2010 (13,500 GBP)

Location East of England, Bedfordshire
https://www.freeadsz.co.uk/x-192354-z

Here we have for sale a 2010 Jaguar XF Premium Luxury V6 Auto in metallic Silver. The Jaguar XF is
one of my personal favourites, a great looking car inside and out, plentiful leg room, ample boot space
and tons of gadgets give it a degree of practicality and its fast, with a 0-60 sprint in just over 7 seconds.
Being a diesel the vehicle can achieve a combined consumption figure of 42mpg so economy there also.
It really does have everything you could ask for, sat-nav, parking sensors and camera, rain sense wipers,
xenon lights, electric heated leather seats, the list goes on. The vehicle has service history with stamps at
24k, 34k and 76k miles and MOT till end of March 2016. She looks great and drives very well. You can
also reserve this car for 48 hours with a £150 refundable deposit. We can tailor car finance around you,
we work with some of the top lenders to get you the best rate, no matter what your credit history. Apply
for finance on our website and get a decision in as quick as 30 seconds. As part of the National Good
Garage Scheme, a thorough 50 point check and HPI check is carried out on all our vehicles. On our
website you can quote yourself on our finance products and also why not try our Part Exchange valuation
tool.
ABS, Immobiliser, Alarm, Traction Control, Central Locking, Remote Central Locking, Power Steering, Air
Conditioning, Climate Control, Cruise Control, Full Leather, Heated Seats, Electric Seats, Electric Front
Windows, Electric Windows, Trip Computer, CD Player, Electric Mirrors, Front Fog Lamps, Parking
Sensors, Height Adjustable Seat, Memory Seats, Adjustable Steering Column, Multi-function Steering
Wheel, Xenon Headlamps, Auto Lighting, Rain-Sensing Wipers, Rear Headrests, Front Centre Armrest,
Multiple Airbags, Dual Climate Zones, Retractable Headrests, Radio, Colour SatNav, Head Restraints,
Rear Armrest, Locking Wheel Nuts, Metallic Paintwork, Colour Coded Body, Lumbar Adjustment,
Steering Wheel Audio Controls, iPod Connectivity, Isofix, Parking Camera, Supplied with Warranty,
Finance Available, Part Exchange Available, Auxiliary
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