
 

The 9th Guangzhou Int039l Flowers, Bonsai amp Garden Exhibition 2017(GBGE2017) (1315 GBP)

Location London, London
https://www.freeadsz.co.uk/x-369825-z

The 9th Guangzhou Int'l Flowers, Bonsai & Garden Exhibition 2017(GBGE2017) Date: March 13th-15th,
2017 Venue: Guangzhou International Sourcing Centre, China Period: Annual Exhibition Area: 15,000
Square Meter ( Estimated ) Exhibitor Amount: 300 ( Estimated ) Professional Visitor Amount: 15,000 (
Estimated) Sponsored Unit: Guangdong Association of Landscape Architecture   Exhibition Scope:
Flowers: fresh cut flower, orchid, potted flower, grass flower; dried flower, artificial flower, etc. Potted
plants: shade-requiring plant, cactus, seed, container vegetable, seedling, seed ball, etc; Florist supplies:
flower arrangement appliance, Flowerpot, vase, artificial plant, floral design, home decorations, etc;
Garden tool: garden machinery, irrigation facilities, flower refrigeration and preservation technology &
equipment, pesticide, fertilizer, peat soil, etc; Garden supplies: wooden house, rockery, sculpture, fence,
outdoor furniture, landscape light, gardening appliance, etc.   Exhibition Profile: Being adjacent to Hong
Kong and Macau, Guangzhou is not only the political, economic and cultural center of China, but also
Asia’s operation center and the axis of post-industrial society. It is also praised as Flower City, great
demand is consequently generated.   Guangzhou Int'l Flowers, Bonsai & Garden Exhibition (GBGE) is the
most professional, profound, authoritative, comprehensive and largest international gathering of flower
industry in Asian floral area at present. GBGE takes place once a year since 2009. The ninth session will
be held in Guangzhou International Sourcing Centre during March 13th-15th, 2017. It’s estimated that
GBGE2017 will gather over 300 enterprises to showcase flowers, pot plants, flowerpots, materials and
equipment, flower shop supplies, garden tools, supplies on site. And it surely will attract a lot of flower
gardening dealers and professional visitors and merchants both at home and abroad, including flower
shopping centers, growers,Society of florists, housing design and landscape.   Welcome to take part in or
visit this exhibition! For exhibitors and visitors registration, please kindly refer to
http://www.pjzwexpo.com/ or email us at click to contact.   Contact US Ms. Mae Law Overseas Organizer
Guangdong Grandeur International Exhibition Group Tel: +86 20 29188711                Fax: +86 20
82579220 E-mail: click to contact;click to contact     Website: http://www.pjzwexpo.com/en
Add: Room202, Meijing Garden, No.318 of Chebei Road, Guangzhou, China                           ;
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