
 

Ford Transit (5,295 GBP)

Location South East, Berkshire
https://www.freeadsz.co.uk/x-446722-z

Wow just have a look at this, This Is as big as a Transit gets the very very rare 430 twin rear wheel! it just
has every thing you would ever want or need. 3 months warranty, Grey Cloth interior, 4x2, Long wheel-
base, Computer (Driver Information System), In Car Entertainment (Radio/Cassette), Towing Equipment
(Preparation), ABS, Day cab, Drivers airbag, High roof, Immobiliser, LWB, PAS, Side loading door,
Remote central locking, Rear parking aid. Solid white, It has 7 rear seats and 2 front including the drivers
but if you donâ€™t want a camper put some more seats in the back or leave it as it is and you would have
a good mini bus! It is fitted with the Much Desired 2.4 Rear Wheel Drive Dura-tec Chain Driven 135bhp
Turbo Diesel engine. Its very easy to drive with the power steering comfort and turbo power all combine
to make it a joy to drive. In gleaming Diamond white. Very High Spec. With such extras as, Rare 430
4250kg gross Model. Twin Rear Wheels.135 PS Turbo Chain Driven Engine. Roof Fans. Tinted glass.
Rear Strip Lights. Lined insulated ceiling walls and Floor. Heavy Duty Floor. Slide Side Door. High Top.
Hand Rail. Cup Holders. Paper Holder. Large Above Head Storage Hole. All around mud flaps. Strip
Lights. 7 rear seats all up to code with built in belts. Cup holders. Rear Black Limo Tints. 6-speed Manual
Transmission. Immobiliser. Arm rest. Power Steering. Rear cage. Heavy duty rear step. Abs. head rests.
Driver SRS impact air bag. New Style trim. Just to mention a few. (Please note, rear electrics may have
been disconnected as is standard on all ex police vehicles), This Transit is direct from The Police Service
which is such a good thing as what you are getting is a Van that has no bad history as how more genuine
can you get than a van direct from the Police Service! PLEASE CALL TO VIEW OR FOR MORE INFO
FORCEVANS.CO.UK BUY FROM THE UK'S BIGGEST EX POLICE VAN DEALER! £5,295 +VAT
ABS, Immobiliser, Remote Central Locking, Power Steering, High
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