
 

Stunning Luxury 2 bedroom holiday home for sale near Bournemouth (78,995 GBP)

Location South West, Hampshire
https://www.freeadsz.co.uk/x-489948-z

This 2014 Regal Symphony 41 x 14 is in immaculate condition and ready to use. The large kitchen with
breakfast bar was designed to enjoy the views through the full length windows and doors, at the front of
the Symphony are double skylights that allow floods of natural light in to the living area. The well planned
fully fitted kitchen is finished with cream high gloss doors and has ample worktop and storage space. The
Symphony is perfectly suited for entertaining with a separate wine cooler and wine rack. The five burner
gas hob with Wok burner, integrated dishwasher, large fridge freezer and built in microwave will make
light work of meal times. The spacious dining area benefits from a large full length window. Sumptuous
seating and reclining armchair for relaxation is complemented by warm tones in the spacious lounge
area. The contemporary fire place provides an attractive focal point within the living space. The lounge
area is enhanced by an ingeniously designed display unit ideally suited for a flat screen TV. The
imaginative use of space continues through to the master bedroom with large en-suite and dressing table.
Full height windows have been incorporated into the design to optimize the use of natural light. The king-
size bed strikes a note of extravagance while the en-suite continues the boutique theme. The second
bedroom benefits from the wider chassis of the Symphony, allowing for two large 2’ 6’’ single beds in
addition to a larger wardrobe space compared with its contemporaries. The family shower room with fully
enclosed shower with sliding glass door is both functional and refined, planned to maximise both space
and facilities. It is fully centrally heated and double glazed and comes complete with a large UPVC
decking on one of the largest pitches on the park. All holiday homes come with site fees until October
2017 and rates until March 2017 and insurance until July 2017 and fully sited on a choice of stunning
locations. All homes are gas and electric tested, valeted inside and out and comes with UPVC steps/
skirting For more information or to view please dont hesitate to contact me on 07785 793 562 07785 793
5...(click to reveal full phone)
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